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Jeremy Clarkson is one of the most popular and controversial broadcasters
in the UK. He is best known for his work on the motoring show Top Gear,
which he presented for 13 years. Clarkson is also a successful author,
having written several books about cars and his life. In 2015, he was
sacked from Top Gear after punching a producer. He has since returned to
television with a new show called The Grand Tour.
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Clarkson: Look Who's Back is the unauthorised biography of Jeremy
Clarkson. The book delves into Clarkson's early life, his rise to fame, and
his many controversies. The book is written by journalist and author Tom
Bower, who has interviewed many of Clarkson's friends, family, and
colleagues. Bower paints a complex and warts-and-all portrait of Clarkson,
revealing his strengths and weaknesses.
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The book is divided into three parts. The first part covers Clarkson's early
life and his rise to fame. The second part focuses on his time on Top Gear,
including his many controversies. The third part covers Clarkson's life after
Top Gear, including his return to television with The Grand Tour.

Clarkson: Look Who's Back is a fascinating and revealing biography of one
of the most popular and controversial broadcasters in the UK. The book is
a must-read for fans of Clarkson and anyone interested in the world of
television.

Early life and career

Jeremy Clarkson was born in Doncaster, Yorkshire, England, on 11 April
1960. His father, Edward Grenville Clarkson, was a teacher, and his
mother, Shirley Gabrielle Ward, was a housewife. Clarkson has two older
sisters, Joanna and Julia.

Clarkson attended Hill House School in Doncaster and Repton School in
Derbyshire. He was expelled from Repton for smoking and drinking. After
leaving school, Clarkson worked as a journalist for the local newspaper, the
Doncaster Free Press.

In 1984, Clarkson joined the BBC as a producer on the motoring show Top
Gear. He became the show's presenter in 1988. Top Gear quickly became
one of the most popular shows on British television. Clarkson's presenting
style was often controversial, but he was also praised for his knowledge of
cars and his sense of humor.

Top Gear years



Clarkson presented Top Gear for 13 years. During that time, the show
became one of the most popular and successful motoring shows in the
world. Clarkson's presenting style was often controversial, but he was also
praised for his knowledge of cars and his sense of humor.

In 2015, Clarkson was sacked from Top Gear after punching a producer.
The incident caused a major scandal and led to Clarkson's departure from
the show. Clarkson's sacking from Top Gear was a major blow to the show
and to Clarkson's career.

Post-Top Gear career

After being sacked from Top Gear, Clarkson returned to television in 2016
with a new show called The Grand Tour. The Grand Tour is a motoring
show that is similar to Top Gear. The show is presented by Clarkson,
Richard Hammond, and James May. The Grand Tour has been a success,
and it has helped Clarkson to rebuild his career.

Clarkson is a controversial figure, but he is also one of the most popular
and successful broadcasters in the UK. He is a talented presenter and a
knowledgeable car enthusiast. Clarkson: Look Who's Back is a fascinating
and revealing biography of one of the most popular and controversial
broadcasters in the UK.



Controversies

Clarkson is a controversial figure, and he has been involved in a number of
scandals over the years. In 2008, he was accused of racism after he used
the n-word in a newspaper column. In 2014, he was accused of sexism
after he made a joke about women drivers. In 2015, he was sacked from
Top Gear after punching a producer.
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Clarkson has apologized for some of his comments, but he has also
defended his right to free speech. He has said that he is not a racist or a
sexist, and that he simply speaks his mind.

Clarkson's controversies have made him a polarizing figure. Some people
believe that he is a talented broadcaster who is not afraid to speak his
mind. Others believe that he is a bigoted and offensive bully.

Jeremy Clarkson is a complex and controversial figure. He is a talented
broadcaster and a knowledgeable car enthusiast. He is also a controversial
figure who has been involved in a number of scandals over the years.

Clarkson: Look Who's Back is a fascinating and revealing biography of one
of the most popular and controversial broadcasters in the UK. The book is
a must-read for fans of Clarkson and anyone interested in the world of
television.
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